Joliet Junior College

Bid for Ultrasound Program Equipment

April 11, 2017 @ 10:00 AM

Redstone Healthcare

Concordance Healthcare

CAE Healthcare

Ultra Solutions

Medline Industries

Technical Development Corp of

Solutions Asia
ITEM|QNTY DESCRIPTION UNIT COST TOTAL COSTf UNIT COST TOTAL COSTf UNIT COST TOTAL COSTf UNIT COST TOTAL COSTR  UNIT COST TOTAL COSTR  UNIT COST TOTAL COST|
$15,349.00 $61,396.00, $26,091.00 $104,364.00 no bid $0.00 $10,200.00 $40,800.00 $27,832.00 $111,328.00 $19,200.00 $76,800.00
1 4 REFURBISHED ACUSON SEQUOIA 512 LCD/FLATSCREEN ULTRASOUND MACHINE; LATEST SOFTWARE: 12.23;
DICOM CAPABILITY; MUST INCLUDE 5 PROBES: 4C1, 15L8w, 6L3, EV-8C4 AND 4V1, NO SUBSTITUTIONS
2 4 STANDARD 1 YEAR WARRANTY FOR REFURBISHED ULTRASOUND MACHINES IN LINE ITEM #1 included $0.00I $2,970.00 $11,880.00) no bid $0.00I $3,500.00 $14,000.00I included $0.00I $1,600.00 $6,400.00
3 ) NEW MIDSCAPULAR THORACENTESIS ULTRASOUND TRAINING MODEL — BLUE PHANTOM ASSURANCE, no bid $0.00I no bid $4,835.74 $9,67l.48l no bid $0.00I no bid $0.00I $5,500.00 $11,000.00
STANDARD WARRANTY, NO SUBSTITUTIONS
$ll,880.00l
TOTAL $61,396.00Q $116,244.00I $9,671.48] $54,800.004 $111,328.00) $94,200.00
Certification of Contract/Bidder Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Notes




